West Orange Public Schools
West Orange, New Jersey 07052

BID SUMMARY AND CONTRACT AWARD RECOMMENDATION

On authorization of the Business Administrator formal bids were solicited for door locks and parts — all
schools, Bid 19-04. This solicitation was made by advertised Public Notice appearing in the Star
Ledger on May 18, 2019.

Bids were sent to the following vendors:

Weilgus & Sons NJ Inc. Light Source The Blue Book
Construct Connect Deltek Fried Brothers (FBI), Inc.
Bell’s Security Sales Independent Hardware, Inc. Accredited Lock Supply Co.

Sealed bids were opened and read aloud on Friday June 7,2019 at 11:15 AM at the Administration Building in
Room 103.

Those in attendance were:

Name Firm

Robert Csigi WOBOE

Mike Hanley WOBOE
Nicole Torrisi WOBOE

Scott Williams Weilgus & Sons

Proposals were received from the following companies:

Weilgus & Sons NJ, Inc. See attached pricing spreadsheet
Fried Brothers, Inc. See attached pricing spreadsheet
Accredited Lock Supply Co. See attached pricing spreadsheet
Independent Hardware Inc. See attached pricing spreadsheet

Recommend award of a contract to Weilgus and Sons NJ Inc., Livingston, NJ for a period of two (2) years, July
1, 2019 — June 30, 2021, for the door and lock parts per the attached pricing spreadsheet. Weilgus and Sons NJ
Inc. has a one (1) year renewal option, July 1, 2021 — June 30, 2022, for the door and lock parts per the attached
pricing spreadsheet.

Recommend award of a contract to Accredited Lock Supply Co., Secaucus, NJ for a period of two (2) years,
July 1, 2019 — June 30, 2021, for the door and lock parts per the attached pricing spreadsheet. Accredited Lock
Supply Co. has a one (1) year renewal option, July 1, 2021 — June 30, 2022, for the door and lock parts per the
attached pricing spreadsheet.

Recommend award of a contract to Fried Brothers Co., Philadelphia, PA for a period of two (2) years, July 1,
2019 — June 30, 2021, for the door and lock parts per the attached pricing spreadsheet. Fried brothers Co. has a
one (1) year renewal option, July 1, 2021 — June 30, 2022, for the door and lock parts per the attached pricing
spreadsheet.

Recommend award of a contract to Independent Hardware Inc., Philadelphia, PA for a period of two (2) years,
July 1, 2019 — June 30, 2021, for the door lock and door parts per the attached pricing spreadsheet.
Independent Hardware Inc. has a one (1) year renewal option, July 1, 2021 — June 30, 2022, for the door lock
and door parts per the attached pricing spreadsheet.



| DOOR LOCKS AND PARTS

Two (2) Year Pricing, Prices to be held for two (2) years.

Base Year July 1, 2019 — June 30, 2021

Replacement Parts Total Cost for Each, Bag or Box

| Mortis Cylinder Shell for I/C Cylinders §  Is56Y each

| Dummy Mortise Cylinder 1 1/8 x 626 $ 4.20 each
Norton 1604BC Door Closer §  51.4i each
LNC 4041XP Super Smooth Regular Arm $ X each
Door Closer i40,11 %
LCN 4040 — 3049 H Cush Hold Open Door b each
Closer Arm 76,01 ¥
Von Duprin 9927EO x US28 Exit Device $§  Hf0.iS each \
Von Duprin 99EO US28 Exit Device $§ 327.¢ each Q
Von Duprin 99DT Exterior Trim $ 68.55 each e
Von Duprin 99NL Exit Device Trim $ AN each %
Von Duprin 24VMULL 10025 KR49547° 6 | § . o
Mullion 3K, f? x
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge RH | § AREA each b3
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge LH | § 23,29 each ®
Best Padlock 41B7-22-L Less Core $ 16.3% each ~N
Don Jo CLP110 — 32D latch Protector 5 je.64 each by
Don Jo Mfg. #9K-S-CW $ 7,Y7 each
Don Jo Mfg. #EF-86 $ 1,66 each
Don Jo Mfg. #FPK-161 $ 3.4S each oF
Push Plate US284 x 16 $ k20 each . 4
Peaks Cylinder Caps (bag of 500) $ 5.3 bag of 500
Segment Springs (bag of 500) $ i3, 7% bag of 500 »*
Peak Core Segments (Various Sizes) $ 3, 7H bag of 100 3
Key Tags 1 1/4” (box of 50) LuckLine 28200 | § .29 box of 50
Key Tags HPPLT-1 (bag of 100) h) 23,78 bag of 100
1CB Best Peaks Core $ Iy, 19 each N
1LCB Best Peaks Core with factory pinning $ 22,50 S
1AK Peaks Key (box of 100) $ 11,58 each
Cylindrical Lockset Heavy Duty Dormitory | § iy 9y each
function, 2 %" Backset, SFIC, Hard Return ' S
Lever, Non-step rose, ANSI strike, Lost
Motion, 626 finish-less core BEST Security
Rim Cylinders Best 7Pin 12E-7-2-8$2-626 $ [£.70 each
Major EB-2L Locking Bar 2 Drawer File Bar | § 17.96 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 3 Drawer File Bar | $ 17,49 each ¥%-
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 4 Drawer File Bar | § HES each K
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 5 Drawer File Bar | § 1979 each *
SecureaKey Cards RKCM02- Pk25 $ S48 each %
SecuraKey Reader RK65K $ i37.61 each ¥
Steelcase Lock Cores $ 7205 each By 3
Hon F24 File Cabinet Lock Kit $ 12,11 each -
A-Zum Cabinet Lock LM0G678 $ [¢,23 each *
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Global LK26 Cabinet Lock Kit 5 It 25 each
-L54G Key Blank (bag of 10) § 3:%8)—ecach *ﬁ

[LCO 1069E Key Blank (bag of 10) 3 4,35 each x

KW-1-BR Key Blank (bag of 10) S Z,9C  each

[LCO [N29 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 2,17  each »r

ILCO 1041H Key Blank (bag of 10) S 231 each Y

[LCO 1970AM Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 2.4]  each <

ILCO 1092BM2 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 2,14 each

ILCO 1092M 1 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 21y each t

ESP AP1 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 3,1 each

% Low bid
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-| —DOOR LOCKS AND PARTS

One (1) Year Pricing. Renewal year
July 1, 2021 — June 30, 2022

Replacement Parts

Total Cost for Each, Bag or Box

Mortis Cylinder Shell for I/C Cylinders by J6 H% each
Dummy Mortise Cvlinder 1 1/8 x 626 $ 4 4i each
Norton 1604BC Door Closer $ €y 37 each
LINC 4041XP Super Smooth Regular Arm S = each
- Door Closer 13,5
LCN 4040 — 3049 H Cush Hold Open Door S o each }
Closer Arm 7119
Von Duprin 9927EO x US28 Exit Device S 43378  each X
Von Duprin 99EO US28 Exit Device S 34335  each ¢
Von Duprin 99DT Exterior Trim S 73 .8 each ‘E
Von Duprin 99NL Exit Device Trim S 32 %4 each
Von Duprin 24VMULL 10025 KR49547°6 | § : each
Mullion 335,57 )L'
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge RH | § 20 each %
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge LH | § 3.8 each
Best Padlock 41B7-22-L Less Core $ 17,33 each ES
DonJo CLP110 — 32D latch Protector $ .7 each X
Don Jo Mfe. #9K-S-CW $ Y.30 each o
Don Jo Mfe. #EF-86 $ Rk each E 4
Don Jo Mfg, #FPK-161 $ 362 ecach X<
Push Plate US284 x 16 $ L4 _each >
Peals Cylinder Caps (bag of 500) $ S.54 bag of 500
Segment Springs (bag of 500) L § 14,3% bag of 500
Pealc Core Segments (Various Sizes) ' Skl bag of 100
Key Tags 1 1/4” (box of 50) LuckLine 28200 | § ¢4 box of 50
Key Tags HPPLT-1 (bag of 100) R 24 97 bag of 100
1CB Best Peaks Core i $ 15:.74 each
1CB Best Peaks Core with factory pinning | $ 239
1AK Peaks Key (box of 100) '8 2% 7.5 each
Cylindrical Lockset Heavy Duty Dormitory | $ 157,48 each
function, 2 % Backset, SFIC, Hard Return
Lever, Non-step rose, ANSI strike, Lost
Motion, 626 finish-less core BEST Security
Rim Cylinders Best 7Pin 12E-7-2-82-626 $ i7 53 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 2 Drawer File Bar | $ j8a7i “each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 3 Drawer File Bar | § (X, 71 each
Major FB-2L. Locking Bar 4 Drawer File Bar | $ 11,0 cach
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 5 Drawer File Bar | § a7/ each
SecureaKey Cards RKCMO2- Pk25 $ 57, 96"eadh ]
SecuraKey Reader RK65K S liq &7 each
Steelcase Lock Cores 3 7 44 each
Hon F24 File Cabinet Lock Kit $ s 7% each
A-Zum Cabinet Lock LMOG78 S i, 74 cach

¥ YXXXEXTFA R *
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Global LK26 Cabinet Lock Kit b 20.% [ each
154G Key Blank (bag of 10) - — $ #-0% — cach — S
[LCO 1069E Key Blank (bag of [0) $ G35 each X-
KW-1-BR Key Blank (bag of 10) $ .90 each
ILCO 1N29 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 2.9 each
ILCO 1041 H Key Blank (bag of 10} $ 399 each ¢
| ILCO 1970AM Key Blank (bag of 10) $ B each
L ILCO 1092BM2 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 3.1 each %
ILCO 1092M 1 Key Blank (bag of L0) $ 2.4 each %
_ESP API Key Blank (bag of 10) $ .05 each
|

’@,\'&M)M M ﬁcwu[@-)/ L, L/ef'f;,u S

Signatureof Authoriz Agent Type or Print Name U
fresiden Juhe 4 2617
Title Date ’
20 -42| 2647

Federal ID # or Social Security #
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——DOOR LOCKS AND PARTS

Two (2) Year Pricing, Prices to be held for two (2) years.
Base Year July 1, 2019 — June 30, 2021

Replacement Parts Total Cost for Each, Bag or Box
Mortis Cylinder Shell for I/C Cylinders $ 7.25 each
Dummy Mortise Cylinder 1 1/8 x 626 § 350 each ¥~
Norfon 1604BC Door Closer $47.75 each A% 2
LNC 4041XP Super Smooth Regular Arm h) each
Door Closer 23271
L.CN 4040 — 3049 H Cush Hold Open Door | § each
Closer Arm J20
Von Duprin 9927EO x US28 Exit Device § 84593 each
Von Duprin 99EO US28 Exit Device §  s566.87 each
Von Duprin 99DT Exterior Trim S 8650 each
Von Duprin 99NL Exit Device Trim § 12530 each
Von Duprin 24VMULL 10025 KR49547° 6 | $ each
Mullion 510.00
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge RH | § 3425 each
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge LH | § ., < each
Best Padlock 41B7-22-L Less Core § 2315 each
Don Jo CLP110 ~ 32D latch Protector $ 1250 each
Don Jo Mfg, #9K-S-CW § 950 each
Don Jo Mfg. #EF-86 $ 2.00 each
Don Jo Mfg, #FPK-161 § 350 each
Push Plate US284 x 16 $ 5.00 gach
Peaks Cylinder Caps (bag of 500) § 6.00 bag of 500
Segment Springs (bag of 500) § 1422 bag of 500
Peak Core Segments (Various Sizes) § 397 bag of 100
Key Tags 1 1/4” (box of 50) LuckIine 28200 [ $ 950 box of 50
Key Tags HPPLT-1 (bag of 100) $ 1350 bag of 100 X
1CB Best Peaks Core $ 2375 each
1CB Best Peaks Core with factory pinning § 3775
1AK Peaks Key (box of 100) g 4450 each
Cylindrical Lockset Heavy Duty Dormitory $ o each
function, 2 %" Backset, SFIC, Hard Return '
Lever, Non-step rose, ANSI strike, Lost
Motion, 626 finish-less core BEST Security
Rim Cylinders Best 7Pin 12E-7-2-32-626 $  23.00 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 2 Drawer File Bar | § 26.00 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 3 Drawer File Bar | § 33.00 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 4 Drawer File Bar | §  39.00 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 5 Drawer File Bar | § 46.00 each
SecurcaKey Cards RKCMO02- Pk25 $ 125.00 gach
SecuraKey Reader RK65K $ 350.00 each
Steelcase Lock Cores $ 2000 each
Hon F24 File Cabinet Lock Kit $ 1500 each
A-Zum Cabinet Lock LM0678 $ 30.00 each
Revised: Jan.2016 54 | Page

6
-
<
)
Y

r




| L DL Var A .
AR TELY

Global LK26 Cabinet Lock it 15.00 each
—{ 154G Key Blank (bag of 10) $—5.00 each
[LCO 1069E Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 830 each
KW-1-BR Key Blank (bag of 10) $  5.00 each
[LCO 1N29 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ s5.00 each
ILCO 1041H Key Blank (bag of 10) § 200 each
[LCO 1970AM Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 500 each
[LCO 1092BM2 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 500 each
ILCO 1092M1 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 5.00 each
ESP AP1 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 500 each

Revised: Jan.2016
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——DOOR LOCIKS AND PARTS

One (1) Year Pricing. Renewal year
July 1, 2021 — June 30, 2022

Replacement Parts Total Cost for Each, Bag or Box
Mortis Cylinder Shell for I/C Cylinders $ 10.00 each
Dummy Mortise Cylinder 1 1/8 x 626 $ 7.50 each
Norton 1604BC Door Closer §. 5500 each *
LNC 4041XP Super Smooth Regular Arm $ each
Door Closer 220.00
LCN 4040 — 3049 H Cush Hold Open Door $ each
Closer Arm 170.00
Von Duprin 9927EO x US28 Exit Device $  990.00 each
Von Duprin 99EO US28 Exit Device $ 689.00 each
Von Duprin 99DT Exterior Trim § 125.00 each
Von Duprin 99NL Exit Device Trim $ 175.00 each
Von Duprin 24VMULL 10025 KR4954 7’6 | § each
Mullion i
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair HingeRH |§ 4750 each
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge LH |$  47.50 each
Best Padlock 41B7-22-L Less Core § 4500 each
Don Jo CLP110 — 32D latch Protector $§ 1750 each
Don Jo Mfg, #9K-8-CW $ 1500 each
Don Jo Mfg, #EF-86 $§ 300 each
Don Jo Mfg. #FPK-161 $ 6.00 each
Push Plate US284 x 16 $ 7.00 each
Peaks Cylinder Caps (bag of 500) $ 10.00 bag of 500
Segment Springs (bag of 500) $ 2100 bag of 500
Peak Core Segments (Various Sizes) $  6.00 bag of 100
Key Tags 1 1/4” (box of 50) LuckLine 28200 | $ 10.00 box of 50
Key Tags HPPLT-1 (bag of 100) $ 17.50 bag of 100 -
1CB Best Peaks Core § 3500 each
1CB Best Peaks Core with factory pinning $ 50.00
1AK Peaks Key (box of 100) §  500.00 each
Cylindrical Lockset Heavy Duty Dormitory | $ each
function, 2 %” Backset, SFIC, Hard Return 350.00
Lever, Non-step rose, ANSI strike, Lost
Motion, 626 finish-less core BEST Security
Rim Cylinders Best 7Pin 12E-7-2-52-626 $ 3250 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 2 Drawer File Bar | $§  44.00 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 3 Drawer File Bar | §  46.00 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 4 Drawer File Bar | § 47-50 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 5 Drawer File Bar | §  52.50 gach
SecureaKey Cards RKCMO02- Pk25 $ 20000 each
SecuraKey Reader RK65K $  400.00 each
Steelcase Lock Cores $  30.00 each
Hon F24 File Cabinet Lock Kit $ 2000 each
A-Zum Cabinet Lock LM0678 $ 3750 each

Revised: Jan.2016
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Global LIK26 Cabinet Lock Kit $§  20.00 each
1554G-Key-Blank-(bag of 10) — - § —0-68 gach— - —- =
ILCO 1069E Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 1200 each
KW-1-BR Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 1000 each
ILCO 1N29 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 1000 each
ILCO 1041H Key Blank (bag of 10) $  10.00 each
ILCO 1970AM Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 10.00 each
ILCO 1092BM2 Key Blank (bag of 10) § 1000 each
ILCO 1092M1 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 1000 each
ESP AP1 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 1000 each
‘ FRANK STANCO
Signature df Withorized Agent Type or Print Name
PRESIDENT 06/06/2019
Title Date

23-1723845
Federal ID # or Social Security #
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|——DOOR LOCKS AND PARTS

Two (2) Year Pricing. Prices to be held for two (2) years.

Base Year July 1, 2019 — June 30, 2021

Replacement Parts Total Cost for Each, Bag or Box
Mortis Cylinder Shell for I/C Cylinders $15.25 each
Dummy Mortise Cylinder 1 1/8 x 626 $4.00 each
Norton 1604BC Door Closer $65.00 each
LNC 4041XP Super Smooth Regular Arm $190.00 each
Door Closer
LCN 4040 — 3049 H Cush Hold Open Door | $108.40 each
Closer Arm
Von Duprin 9927EQ x US28 Exit Device §718.75 each
Von Duprin 99EO US28 Exit Device §481.75 each
Von Duprin 99DT Exterior Trim $101.50 each
Von Duprin 99NL Exit Device Trim $109.20 each
Von Duprin 24VMULL 10025 KR4954 7" 6 | $438.40 each
Mullion
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge RH | $36.00 each
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge LH | $36.00 each
Best Padlock 41B7-22-1 Less Core $27.70 each
Don Jo CLP110 - 32D latch Protector $13.00 each
Don Jo Mfg. #9K-S-CW $12.00 each
Don Jo Mfg. #EF-86 $1.95 each
Don Jo Mfg. #FPK-161 $5.20 each
Push Plate US284 x 16 $4.25 each
Peaks Cylinder Caps (bag of 500) $8.00 bag of 500
Segment Springs (bag of 500) $19.00 bag of 500
Peak Core Segments (Various Sizes) $4.90 bag of 100
Key Tags 1 1/4” (box of 50) LuckLine 28200 | $7.40 box of 50 H
Key Tags HPPLT-1 (bag of 100) $17.50 bag of 100
1CB Best Peaks Core $25.20 each
1CB Best Peaks Core with factory pinning $42.00 each
1AK Peaks Key (box of 100) $390.00 each box of 100
Cylindrical Lockset Heavy Duty Dormitory | $259.50 each
function, 2 %” Backset, SFIC, Hard Return
Lever, Non-step rose, ANSI strike, Lost
Motion, 626 finish-less core BEST Security
Rim Cylinders Best 7Pin 12E-7-2-82-626 $26.25 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 2 Drawer File Bar | $31.50 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 3 Drawer File Bar | $32.75 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 4 Drawer File Bar | $38.00 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 5 Drawer File Bar | $43.50 each
SecureaKey Cards RKCMO02- Pk25 $ NOBID each
SecuraKey Reader RK65K $§ NO BID each
Steelcase Lock Cores $ NO BID each
Hon F24 File Cabinet Lock Kit $ 7.50 each
A-Zum Cabinet Lock LM0678 $ NOBID each

Revised: Jan.2016
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Global LK26 Cabinet Look Kit 3 6.0 Sach s
154G Key Blank (bag of 10) : $ 400 each bag of tH—
ILCO 1069E Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 5.70 each- bag of 10
KW-1-BR Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 2.50 each bagof 10 >*
[LCO 1N29 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 3.90 each- bag of 10
[LCO 1041H Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 3.90 each- bag of 10
ILCO 1970AM Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 3.90 each bag of 10
TLCO 1092BM2 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 3.90 each bag of 10
ILCO 1092M1 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 390 each- bag of 10
ESP AP1 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 2.80 each bag of 10 e

¥ Low Oid

Revised: Jan.2016
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———— —DOOR LOCKS AND PARTS

7

One (1) Year Pricing. Renewal year
July 1, 2021 - June 30, 2022

Replacement Parts Total Cost for Each, Bag or Box
Mortis Cylinder Shell for I/C Cylinders $ 16.00 each
Dummy Mortise Cylinder 1 1/8 x 626 $4.20 each
Norton 1604BC Door Closer $68.25 each
LNC 4041XP Super Smooth Regular Arm $199.50 each
Door Closer
LCN 4040 — 3049 H Cush Hold Open Door | $113.80 each
Closer Arm
Von Duprin 9927EO x US28 Exit Device $754.75 each
Von Duprin 99EO US28 Exit Device $505.80 each
Von Duprin 99DT Exterior Trim $106.50 each
Von Duprin 99NL Exit Device Trim $114.60 each
Von Duprin 24VMULL 10025 KR4954 7’ 6 | $460.30 each
Mullion
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge RH | $37.80 each
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge LH | $37.80 each
Best Padlock 41B7-22-L Less Core $29.00 each
Don Jo CLP110 - 32D latch Protector $13.65 each
Don Jo Mfg. #9K-S-CW $12.60 each
Don Jo Mfg, #EF-86 $2.05 each
Don Jo Mfg. #FPK-161 $545 each
Push Plate US284 x 16 $4.45 each
Peaks Cylinder Caps (bag of 500) $8.40 bag of 500
Segment Springs (bag of 500) $20.00 bag of 500
Peak Core Segments (Various Sizes) $5.15 bag of 100
Key Tags 1 1/4” (box of 50) LuckLine 28200 | $7 75 box of 50 ﬁ
Key Tags HPPLT-1 (bag of 100) $1835 bag of 100
1CB Best Peaks Core $26.45 each
1CB Best Peaks Core with factory pinning $44.00 each
1AK Peaks Key (box of 100) $409.50 eaeh box of 100
Cylindrical Lockset Heavy Duty Dormitory | $272.50 each
function, 2 %” Backset, SFIC, Hard Return
Lever, Non-step rose, ANSI strike, Lost
Motion, 626 finish-less core BEST Security
Rim Cylinders Best 7Pin 12E-7-2-S2-626 $27.50 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 2 Drawer File Bar | $ 33.00 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 3 Drawer File Bar | § 34.35 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 4 Drawer File Bar | $ 39.90 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 5 Drawer File Bar | $ 45.65 each
SecureaKey Cards RKCM02- Pk25 $§ NO BID each
SecuraKey Reader RK65K $ NO BID each
Steelcase Lock Cores $ NO BID each
Hon F24 File Cabinet Lock Kit $7.85 each ‘%’
A-Zum Cabinet Lock LM0678 $ NO BID each

Revised: Jan.2016
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Global LK26 Cabinet Lock Kit $6.60 each
554G Key-Blank-(bag of 10) - - $426 eaeh—bag of 10 -
ILCO 1069E Key Blank (bag of 10) $6.00 each bag of 10
KW-1-BR Key Blank (bag of 10) $2.60 each bag of 10 *
ILCO 1N29 Key Blank (bag of 10) $4.10 -each bag of 10
ILCO 1041H Key Blank (bag of 10) $4.10 each bagof 10
ILCO 1970AM Key Blank (bag of 10) $4.10 each bag of 10
ILCO 1092BM2 Key Blank (bag of 10) $4.10 gach bagof 10
ILCO 1092M1 Key Blank (bag of 10) $4.10 gach bag of 10
ESP API Key Blank (bag of 10) $2.95 gach bag of 10 > <
%@/’WA_ Robert Ditko
Signature of Autl{orized Agent Type or Print Name
Bid Administrator 6/5/19
Title Date
22-2054109
Federal ID # or Social Security #
57 | Page
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————DOOR LOCKS AND PARTS

Two (2) Year Pricing. Prices to be held for two (2) years.
Base Year July 1, 2019 — June 30, 2021

Replacement Parts Total Cost for Each, Bag or Box
Mortis Cylinder Shell for I/C Cylinders SRS SR each *—
Dummy Mortise Cylinder 1 1/8 x 626 $ S.70 each
Norton 1604BC Door Closer § 55.5£ each
LNC 4041XP Super Smooth Regular Arm $ each
| | Door Closer S fedd
' LCN 4040 - 3049 H Cush Hold Open Door | § each
Closer Arm 133.4/
Von Duprin 9927EQO x US28 Exit Device $ §75.7// each
Von Duprin 99EO US28 Exit Device $ 653, §) each
Von Duprin 99DT Exterior Trim $ J3Y. ¥7 each
Von Duprin 99NL Exit Device Trim $ /¥Y. 5 { each
Von Duprin 24VMULL 10025 KR4954 776 | §

each
Mullion SP. 2y

Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair HingeRH [§ 3/, 32 each
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge LH |§ /. 32 each

Best Padlock 41B7-22-L. Less Core $ Y/ each

Don Jo CLP110 — 32D latch Protector $§ /3. )9 each

Don Jo Mfg, #9K-S-CW $ Y. F1 each

Don Jo Mfa. #EF-86 MR 2%
Don Jo Mfg. #FPK-161 § 3.8 3  each

Push Plate US284 x 16 $ 9.7/ each
Peaks Cylinder Caps (bag of 500) $ Y 5Y bag of 500
Segment Springs (bag of 500) § dhary bag of 500
Peak Core Segments (Various Sizes) § §5.577% bag of 100
Key Tags 1 1/4” (box of 50) LuckLine 28200 | $ Y5 o box of 50
Key Tags HPPLT-1 (bag of 100) $ 7L.00 bag of 100
1CB Best Peaks Core $ /7. %/  each

1CB Best Peaks Core with factory pinning $ 29.0)

1AK Peaks Key (box of 100) $ 270.3%F each
Cylindrical Lockset Heavy Duty Dormitory | $ each

function, 2 %™ Backset, SFIC, Hard Return
Lever, Non-step rose, ANSI strike, Lost _
Motion, 626 finish-less core BEST Security /3 7, g /
Rim Cylinders Best 7Pin 12E-7-2-82-626 e each N
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 2 Drawer File Bar 2.5 7 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 3 Drawer File Bar 23.9/ each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 4 Drawer File Bar 5 J: ¥/ each

Major FB-2L Locking Bar 5 Drawer File Bar each
SecureaKey Cards RKCMO02- Pk25 )y 7 each
SecuraKey Reader RK65K A00 each
Steelcase Lock Cores 2500 each
Hon F24 File Cabinet Lock Kit 23.00 each

%})\
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A-Zum Cabinet Lock LM0678 AS . 0o each
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Tobal TK26 Cabinet Lock Kit 3 ) oo each =~ U0
154G Key Blank (bag of 10) $ &—mns—each - gz
ILCO 1069E Key Blank (bag of 10) $ /S nc>  each
KW-1-BR Key Blank (bag of 10) $ L .00 each
[LCO 1N29 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ D, 00  each
[LCO 1041H Key Blank (bag of 10) $ Sz .02 each
[LCO 1970AM Key Blank (bag of 10) $ O A e each
ILCO 1092BM2 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ Y, 4o each
ILCO 1092M1 Key Blank (bag of 10) § s5.00 each
ESP AP1 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ Y. 00 each
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——DOOR LOCKS AND PARTS

One (1) Year Pricing. Renewal year
July 1, 2021 — June 30, 2022

Replacement Parts Total Cost for Each, Bag or Box
Mortis Cylinder Shell for I/C Cylinders $ 7. Yo each -}G
Dummy Mortise Cylinder 1 1/8 x 626 $ ¢/, ¢7  each
Norton 1604BC Door Closer $ 4654 each I
LNC 4041XP Super Smooth Regular Arm $ , each
Door Closer i 3 7 f 5 /
LCN 4040 — 3049 H Cush Hold Open Door $ _ each
Closer Arm - / L/? 5 7/
Von Duprin 9927EO x US28 Exit Device $ /677 .7 /each
Von Duprin 99EQO US28 Exit Device $ 7/ ¥, Jleach
Von Duprin 99DT Exterior Trim $ J/ Jp.@ each
Von Duprin 99NL Exit Device Trim $ /¢ 0. 02 each
Von Duprin 24VMULL 10025 KR49547° 6 | § _ each
Mullion 375 Y0, 4»
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge RH | § £3. 17 oo each
Markar Adams Rite B1923 Repair Hinge LH | § 7 35 0o each
Best Padlock 41B7-22-L Less Core $ /f. 0> each
Don Jo CLP110 — 32D latch Protector $ /Y, 6o each
Don Jo Mfg, #9K-S-CW $ 9.3 o each
Don Jo Mfg, #EF-86 $ 2. & ¢ each
Don Jo Mfg. #FPK-161 $ Y.Co  each
Push Plate US284 x 16 $ 5./  each
Peaks Cylinder Caps (bag of 500) $ S./0  bagof500
Segment Springs (bag of 500) $ .95  bagof 500
Pealc Core Segments (Various Sizes) $ (- /o  bagof100
Key Tags 1 1/4” (box of 50) LuckLine 28200 | § .35 box of 50
Key Tags HPPLT-1 (bag of 100) $ /2. £ bagof 100
1CB Best Peaks Core $ /4, &p  each
1CB Best Peaks Core with factory pinning $ Y. 00
1AK Peaks Key (box of 100) $ /6, 6o  each
Cylindrical Lockset Heavy Duty Dormitory | $ each
function, 2 %” Backset, SFIC, Hard Return
Lever, Non-step rose, ANSI strike, Lost
Motion, 626 finish-less core BEST Security / f d. 0
Rim Cylinders Best 7Pin 12E-7-2-8§2-626 $ /7.6 each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 2 Drawer File Bar | $ A4.9C  each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 3 Drawer FileBar [$ 2.5, Y%/  ecach
Major FB-2L Locking Bar 4 Drawer File Bar | $ 25. Y% / each
Major FB-2L Locking Bar § Drawer FileBar |[§ 2. 3/ each
SecureaKey Cards RKCM02- Pk25 $ /40 each
SecuraKey Reader RK65K $ A Lo each
Steelcase Lock Cores $ 13.00  each
Hon F24 File Cabinet Lock Kit $ AS. o each
A-Zum Cabinet Lock LM0678 $ 15.00 each
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Global LK26 Cabinet Lock Kit

-7, 7 ¢ each

-E54G-Key-Blank-(bag of 10) - - $ 7—4%o—each— - -
ILCO 1069E Key Blank (bag of 10) $ /6, 50 each

KW-1-BR Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 3 3o each

ILCO IN29 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ ~Jo  each -K—
ILCO 1041H Key Blank (bag of 10) $ :5" d & each

ILCO 1970AM Key Blank (bag of 10) $ %, 70 each

ILCO 1092BM2 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ Y. Y ¢ each

ILCO 1092M1 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ 5.50 each

ESP AP1 Key Blank (bag of 10) $ Y. 4o _ each

/ fL%/ g fAm i / // 74}) Gv ﬁ

SI gnature of Authorized Agent Type or Print Name

1¢24 7L2‘/’ww Wdﬁ '45//:4- 6- 3= o/ 4

Title Date

Y6=0632= )2

Federal ID # or Social Security #
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